

VEGETABLES
FIXED QUARTERLY PRICING
Pricing Per Unit Indicated

ITEM	SPEC	PACK SIZE NET WEIGHT	PACK SIZE IF DIFF.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	PRICING 1ST QUARTER	PRICING 2ND QUARTER	PRICING 3RD QUARTER	PRICING 4TH QUARTER	Comments
					July Aug Sept	Oct Nov Dec	Jan Feb Mar	April May June	
Bell Pepper, Green	U.S. Grade 2, Chopping -4 per Lb	Case/25 Lbs		0	15.5	18.5	13.5	17.5	
Bell Pepper, Green	Chopping -4 per Lb	Lbs	5 lbs	31	9.5	9.5	9.5	9.5	
Bell Pepper, Red	U.S. Grade 2	Bag/5 Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Bell Pepper, Red	U.S. Grade 2, Chopping -4 per Lb	Lbs	5 lbs	23	12.5	12.5	12.5	12.5	
Bell Pepper, Yellow	U.S. Grade 2, Chopping -4 per Lb	Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Broccoli, Florets	U.S. No. 1	5 lb bag	3 lbs	667	5.5	5.5	5.5	5.5	
Broccoli, Florets	U.S. No. 1	4/5 lb	4/3 lbs	165	22.5	22.5	22.5	22.5	
Broccoli, Fresh	U.S. No. 1, 5"-9" Stalk Lengthy, Minimum 4" Head Diameter	Each/-2 Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cabbage, Coleslaw Mix									
Cabbage, Green	Shredded	5 lb bag	4/5 lb	462	14.85	14.85	14.85	14.85	
Cabbage, Green	Shredded	5 lb bag	4/5 lb	174	15.85	15.85	15.85	15.85	
Cabbage, Red	Shredded	5 lb bag		26	8.95	8.95	8.95	8.95	
Carrots	3" Sticks	5 lb bag	2/5 lb	80	18.55	18.55	18.55	18.55	
Carrots	Shredded	5 lb bag	2/5 lb	103	11.25	11.25	11.25	11.25	
Carrots, Baby	Mini/Slim Peeled 5 lb	5 lb bag	4/5 lb	1916	19.95	19.95	19.95	19.95	
Carrots, Baby	Mini/Slim Peeled 4/5lb.	20 lb.	4/5 lb	3356	19.95	19.95	19.95	19.95	
Carrots, Baby	IW, 1/2 c. Mini Peeled	100/3 oz		1497	20.25	20.25	20.25	20.25	
Cauliflower	Uniform compact, white curds; Not>10% of surface discoloration	3 Each	4 ct	60	12.25	14.25	12.25	14.25	
Cauliflower Buds	Bag	5 lb bag	2/3 lb	169	17.75	17.75	26.85	19.35	
Cauliflower Buds	Bag	4/5 lb	2/3 lb	17	17.75	17.75	26.85	19.35	
Celery	Diced	5 lb bag		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Celery	Sticks 4" Uniform/ Stack Pack	5 lb bag	2/5 lb	906	21.5	21.5	21.5	21.5	
Celery	Sticks 4" Uniform/ Stack Pack	4/5 lb	2/5 lb	72	21.5	21.5	21.5	21.5	
Celery	IW	50/3oz.	50/2oz	54	17.85	17.85	17.85	17.85	
Celery, Stalk	U.S. No. 1	Each/2 Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cilantro	U.S. No. 1- Cleaned & Trimmed	4/1 lb		42	17	17	17	17	
Cucumber	Case/36 -28 Lbs	Case/36 -28 Lbs		755	16.25	16.25	19.75	15.85	
Cucumber, Each	Lbs	Lbs		1401	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cucumbers, Coin	1/4" Cut	5 lb.		18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cucumbers, Diced	1/4" Cut	5 lb.		46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cucumbers, Sliced	IW	50/4oz.	50/2 oz	62	24	24	24	24	
Fajita Mix Sliced 1/4"	Green & Red Bells & Onions	5 lb bag		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Jicama Sticks	4" X 3/8", Uniform, Stack Pack	5 lb bag	2/5 lb	1294	31	31	31	31
Jicama Sticks	4" X 3/8", Uniform, Stack Pack	4/5 lb	2/5 lb	237	31	31	31	31
Jicama Sticks	IW	50/3oz		28	31.25	31.25	31.25	31.25
Kale	Each	Each		154	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Lettuce 1-way	chopped	4/5#		31	16.5	16.5	16.5	16.5
Lettuce 1-way	chopped	5#	4/5 lb	154	16.5	16.5	16.5	16.5
Lettuce, 3-way Romaine	Bag	5 lb.	4/5 lb	5575	20.5	20.5	20.5	20.5
Lettuce, 3-way Romaine	Bag	4/5lb		266	20.5	20.5	20.5	20.5
Lettuce, 4-way, chopped	Bag	5 lb.		845	5.85	5.85	5.85	5.85
Lettuce, 4-way, chopped	Bag	4/5lb		676	14.85	14.85	14.85	14.85
Lettuce, green leaf	Each	24 ct.		48	17.5	17.5	23.5	19.25
Lettuce, iceberg	Each	1 ct.	6ct	77	8.85	8.85	8.85	8.85
Lettuce, Iceberg, Shredded	Bag	5 lb bag		594	5.85	5.85	5.85	5.85
Lettuce, Iceberg, Shredded	Bag	4/5lb.	4/5 lb	231	14.5	14.5	14.5	14.5
Lettuce, Romaine	Shredded	5 lb.	6/2 lb	655	18.85	24.85	24.85	18.85
Lettuce, Romaine	Chopped	6/2lb.		1497	18	18	19	18.5
Lettuce, Romaine	Chopped	2 lb bag	6/2 lb	385	18	18	19	18.5
Lettuce, Shredded 4/5#	Bag	4/5lb		28	14.5	14.5	14.5	14.5
Lettuce, Shredded 5#	Bag	5 lb.		131	5.85	5.85	5.85	5.85
Lettuce., Spring Mix 3#	Bag	3 lb.		245	6.85	6.85	6.85	6.85
Lettuce, 3-way Mix	Bag	5 lb	4/5 lb	77	14.85	14.85	14.85	14.85
Mushrooms, White	85% U.S. No. 1 Large	Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Onion, Green	U.S. No. 1	Bunch		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Onion, Red	U.S. No. 1 Medium Size	Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Onion, Red	U.S. No. 1 Medium Size	Lbs	5 lbs	59	5.5	5.5	5.5	5.5
Onion, Yellow	U.S. No. 1 Medium Size	Lbs	5 lbs	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Onions, Diced	1/4" diced	5 lb bag		108	6.95	6.95	6.95	6.95
Onions, Green Sliced	1/4" sliced	6 lb bag		28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Onions, Red Sliced	1/8" sliced	5 lb bag	2/5 lb	92	19.5	19.5	19.5	19.5
Parsley	Minimum 3-1/2" Lb/Doz Bunches U.S. No. 2	Bunch		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Peas, Sugar Snap	Stringless, Ready to use		4/2 lb	31	28	28	28	28
Peppers, Bell - Green	diced	5 lb bag	2/5 lb	15	24.5	24.5	24.5	24.5
Peppers, Bell - Green	sliced	5 lb.		15	18.5	18.5	18.5	18.5
Peppers, Bell - Red	diced	5 lb bag	2/5 lb	31	22.5	22.5 #	22.5	22.5
Peppers, Bell - Red	sliced	5 lb.	2/5 lb	154	36	36	36	28.5
Peppers, Bell - Tri-color	sliced	5 lb.	2/5 lb	39	28.5	28.5	28.5	28.5
Pico De Gallo	tray	2/5lb.		413	28.5	28.5	28.5	28.5
Potato	Russet U.S. No. 1	Case/80 Ct		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Potato, Russet (unwrapped)		90 ct.		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Potato, Russet Foil Wrapped		90 ct.		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pumpkin	Mini	40 ct		12	0	30	0	0
Pumpkin	Small 6-9 lbs	Each		15	0	4.25	0	0

Pumpkin	medium 10-16 lbs	Each		31	0	5.85	0	0	
Pumpkin	Large 18-24 lbs	Each		15	0	8.35	0	0	
Radishes, w/Tops	Red Topped, Cleaned, U.S. No. 1	Pack/6 oz Bunch		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Salsa	Mild	5 lb tub	4/1 gal	169	52	52	52	52	fresh salsa
Spinach, Baby	Cleaned, Without Stems	2.5 lb bag		1925	7.5	7.5	7.5	7.5	
Spinach, Baby	Cleaned, Without Stems	4/2.5 lb		145	16.5	16.5	16.5	16.5	
Stir Fry Vegetables	Sliced Carrots, Celery, Bokchoy, Onions, Broccoli Buds	5 lb bag		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Tomato	Diced	5 lb.	2/5 lb	208	22.5	22.5	22.5	22.5	
Tomato	U.S. No., 1, Light Red to Red, Loose Pack, Best Buy	Case/25#		60	27.5	44.5	26.5	21.5	
Tomato	Sliced	5 lb. tray	2/5 lb	1024	25.25	25.25	25.25	25.25	
Tomato 6X6X2	U.S. No. 1, Light Red to Red, Layer Pack or U.S. Large Loose Pack Approx 72 Ea (2-16/32" - 2-25/32")	Case/20 Lbs		450	20.5	20.5	16.8	17.5	
Tomato Cherry	U.S. No. 1	Case-12/1 pt.		31	30	35	26.5	20.5	
Tomato Grape	U.S. No 1	1 pt.	12/ 1 pt	1782	14.5	14.5	14.5	14.5	
Tomato Grape	U.S. No 1	Case-12/1 pt.		767	14.5	14.5	14.5	14.5	
Zucchini Coin	1/4" cut	5 lb	2/5 lb	132	28.5	33.5	33.5	28.5	
Zucchini Sticks	tray	4 lb	5 lbs	927	25	28	28	25	
Zucchini Sticks	3 oz. pack	50/3oz.	50/2 oz	100	23.5	23.5	23.5	23.5	
Zucchini Sticks	Bag	5 lb.		63	25	28	28	25	
Zucchini, Sticks	Bag	4/5lb	5 lbs	34	25	28	28	25	