

**FRUIT**  
**FIXED QUARTERLY PRICING**  
**Pricing Per Unit Indicated**

ITEM	SPEC	PACK SIZE NET WEIGHT	PACK SIZE IF DIFF.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	PRICING 1ST QUARTER	PRICING 2ND QUARTER	PRICING 3RD QUARTER	PRICING 4TH QUARTER	Comments
					July Aug Sept	Oct Nov Dec	Jan Feb Mar	April May June	
Apple sliced Opal	IW	200/2 oz		91	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
Apple, Red Delicious	Apple Eating, U.S. Fancy Grade Tray Packed	Case/163 ct.		377	23.5	25.5	24.5	22.5	
Apple, Red Delicious	Apple Eating, U.S. Fancy Grade Tray Packed	Case/138 ct.		616	28.5	26.5	25.5	25.5	
Apple, Red- Variety	Apple Eating, U.S. Fancy Grade Tray Packed	Case/138 ct.		200	24.85	24.85	27.85	27.85	
Apples Sliced Green	Bulk	12/3 lb		77	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Apples Sliced Green	Bulk	8/1.5#		154	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Apples Sliced Red or Green	IW	200/2 oz	100/2oz	3519	26.75	26.75	26.75	26.75	
Apples Sliced Red or Green	IW	100/2 oz		86	26.75	26.75	26.75	26.75	
Apples, Fancy Red/Green	Apple Eating, U.S. Fancy Grade Tray Packed	Case/125 Ct		156	29.5	29.5	33.5	31.5	
Apples, Gala	Apple Eating, U.S. Fancy Grade Tray Packed	Case/163 Ct		1505	33	28.5	26.5	24.5	
Apples, Granny Smith	Apple Eating, U.S. Fancy Grade Tray Packed	Case/163 Ct		447	48.5	38.5	36.5	34.5	
Bananas, Petite	4 1/2" to 5 1/2", Condition A; Peel color 5-6 @ Time of Inspection, Ripe	Case/150 Ct/40 Lbs		1691	20.85	20.85	20.85	20.85	
Bananas, Petite	4 1/2" to 5 1/2", Condition A; Peel color 5-6 @ Time of Inspection, Ripe	Per lb.		1500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Bananas, Petite	4 1/2" to 5 1/2", Condition A; Peel color 3-4 @ Time of Inspection, Green Tip	Case/150 Ct/40 Lbs		535	20.85	20.85	20.85	20.85	
Cantaloupe Chunks		5lb	8 lbs	527	16.85	16.85	15.85	15.85	
Cantaloupe Chunks		4/2.5 lb.		68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cantaloupe Diced		5lb		505	22.85	22.85	22.85	22.85	
Grape Escape	IW	100/3oz.		1232	44.85	44.85	46.85	46.85	
Grapes, Green	U.S. No 1, Table, Seedless	20#/cs		308	25.5	29.5	36.5	49	
Grapes, Lunch Bunch	U.S. No. 1, Table, Seedless	Case/150 Servings 23 Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Grapes, Lunch Bunch		150 ct.		2864	35.5	35.5	35.5	35.5	
Grapes, Red	U.S. No 1, Table, Seedless	20#/cs		1203	25.5	27.5	34.5	27.5	
Kiwi	Ripe, Slightly Firm, Not Hard, Size 36	Case/96-110 Each Ct/ Volume Fill/22 Lbs		1098	14.25	13.5	13.5	12.5	
Lemon	U.S. No 1	each	34ct	10	14.25	14.25	14.25	14.25	

Lime	U.S. No 1	each	48 ct	50	16	16	16	16
Mango Chunks	Bulk	4/2.5 lb.	5 lbs	501	85	85	85	85
Mango Chunks	IW	48/3 oz.	50/2oz	77	42.5	42.5	42.5	42.5
Melon Mix w/grapes Cup	IW	48/3oz.		31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Melon, Cantaloupe	U.S. No. 1, 3 Lbs Ea, 90% Free From Defects	Case/12 Ct 36 Lbs		231	14.5	18.95	18.95	18.25
Melon, Cantaloupe	4 Lbs	Each/4 Lbs	3 ct	493	8.75	9.5	9.5	9.25
Melon, Honey Dew	U.S. No. 1, 8" diameter, 5-6 ct, 30#/Case	Case/5-6 Ct		231	15.25	17.5	18	19
Melon, Honey Dew	U.S. No. 1, 8" diameter, 5-6 ct	Each/5 Lbs	3 ct	116	12	12	12	13
Melon, Watermelon, Seedless	U.S. No. 1, Bulk, 90-100#/Case	Case 4 Ct	3 ct	385	29	30	35.5	26.5
Melon, Watermelon, Seedless, with seeds	U.S. No. 1, Bulk	Each/20 Lbs		308	9.25	13.5	12.5	10.25
Nectarines	Best Available, 72 size, Volume Filled Slightly Soft to Touch; Yellow - No Green	Case/100 Ct Size 72		578	30.5	38.5	38.5	38.5
Oranges	Provide Choice During Peak Season, Well Colored	Case/138 Ct 40 Lbs		1640	31	33	22.5	25
Oranges, Blood		Case/68 Ct		154	66	43	23.5	26.5
Oranges, Cara Cara		Case/138 Ct 40 Lbs		154	49	32	25.5	30
Peaches, White, Yellow	Mature But Not Soft or Over Ripe, Well-Formed,	Case/100 Ct Size 72		154	37.5			40
Pear, Asian, Golden	Firm-Ripe, 90% Free From Defects	28#/cs		154	27.5	23.5	22.5	22
Pears, Anjou, Green or Red	Firm-Ripe, 90% Free From Defects	Case/36 Lbs 150 Ct		970	29.5	25.5	29.75	33.5
Pears, Bartlett, Yellow	Firm-Ripe, 90% Free From Defects	Case/36 Lbs 150 Ct		39	29.5	25.5		33.5
Pears, Variety	Firm-Ripe, 90% Free From Defects	Case/ 135 Ct		154	29.5	25.5	29.75	33.5
Persimmon Fuyu		Case/100 Ct 64 sz.		77		25	19	
Pico De Gallo	Bulk	2/5 lb.		116	25	25	25	25
Pineapple	Hawaiian Pineapple U.S. No. 1	Case/10 Ct 25 Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pineapple	Hawaiian Pineapple U.S. No. 1	Each/3.5 Lbs		0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pineapple Chunks		4/2.5 lb.	8 lbs	259	23.5	23.5	23.5	23.5
Pineapple Spears		50/ 2.7 oz.		385	47.5	47.5	47.5	47.5
Plums, Black or Red	U.S. No. 1, Firm-Ripe, Mature, Size 70, Best in the Season, 90% Free From Defects/-2"	Case/130 Size 70		655	29			36
Pluots	U.S. No. 1, Firm-Ripe, Mature, Size 70, Best in the Season, 90% Free From Defects/-2"	Case/130 Ct 50 sz.	45-	270	27.5	40	37.5	35.5
Strawberries	U.S. No. 1 Full Color	8 x 1 Lbs. Clamshell		770	16.5	28.5	23.85	19.85
Tangelos	85% U.S. No. 1, Well- Colored, Large Size (approximately 37 Lb/Ct)	Case/100 Ct		77		33	37	

